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HD Supply Waterworks

11323 Cloverland Ave.,  

Baton Rouge, LA   70809 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $686.00 $408.00 No Bid No Bid

Baton Rouge Winwater 

Works

8940 Buzbee Drive,    

Baton Rouge, LA   70809 $900.00 $225.00 $165.00 $205.00 $182.00 $205.00 $300.00 $1,700.00 $2,490.00 $740.00 $500.00  $4,550.00  $5,350.00 

Number of Bids Received:   2

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST PARISH                                                                                                  

1801 West Airline Highway                                                                      

LaPlace, LA   70068                                                                               

www.sjbparish.com 

BID NAME:  2016 Water Meters & Registers

Bid Opening:  October 13, 2015         3:00 P.M.                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 


