2016 Warehouse Sewer

St. John the Baptist Parish Council

Water Fittings Supplies Bid

2016 Water & Sewer Fittings Bid Tabulation

Bid Date: Nov. 17, 2015

Baton Rouge HD Supply Coburn's| Fergusen dba| General Mill

Winwater Waterworks| Cimsco Inc. Supply LA Utilities Supply

Section 1 $2.07 $2.08 $1.90 $2.95 2.0350 NO BID
Section 2 $5.85 $4.53 $5.14 $6.20 $4.90 NO BID
Section 3 $36.36 NO BID $32.62 $54.83 $18.15 NO BID

MTCUTITYICELE
Section 4 $6,373.00 section bid $6,658.20 $8,569.00 $6,638.70 NO BID
Section 5 $481.50 $490.48 $483.51 $549.00 $476.70 NO BID
Incomplete
Section 6 $483.10 $496.34 $448.84|  Section Bid $432.65 NO BID
Section 7 $139.45 $145.54 $142.02 NO BID $140.85 NO BID
Section 8 $137.00 $138.04 $241.00 $135.00 $133.45 NO BID
Sect. Withdrawn

Section 9 $1,097.55 $1,043.68 $1,108.35 $1,354.00 186.5 NO BID
Section 10 $84.05 $86.37 $84.20 NO BID $86.65 NO BID
Section 11 $322.00 $230.08 $271.00 $264.00 $243.05 NO BID
Section 12 $181.75 $193.88 $200.02 $208.95 $182.30 NO BID
Section 13 $195.00 $193.88 $190.25 $185.00 $187.25 NO BID
Section 14 $5,345.00 $5,316.00 $5,317.83 $9,319.00 $5,246.00 NO BID
Section 15 $79.47 $1,123.69 $1,101.62 $1,348.40 $1,092.30 NO BID
Section 16 $90.00 $53.05 $51.06 $57.65 $75.00 NO BID




St. John the Baptist Parish Council
2016 Warehouse Sewer Water Fittings Supplies Bid

2016 Water & Sewer Fittings Bid Tabulation Bid Date: Nov. 17, 2015
Baton Rouge HD Supply Coburn's| Fergusen dba| General Mill
Winwater Waterworks| Cimsco Inc. Supply LA Utilities Supply
Section 17 $449.00 $448.58 $499.20 $456.00 $447.00 NO BID
Section 18 $307.00 $306.97 $337.31 s;;|o:E|; $303.60 NO BID
Section 19 $252.35 $253.18 $247.77 $262.00 $249.10 NO BID
Section 20 $103.00 $98.23 $113.90 $100.00 $106.10 NO BID
Section 21 $246.50 $216.85 $179.35 $224.15 $177.23 NO BID
Section 22 $79.95 $79.47 $92.35 $138.00 $81.25 NO BID
Section 23 A $59.10 $58.63 NO BID NO BID $58.30 NO BID
Section 23 B $33.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.00 NO BID
Section 24 $65.50 $85.98 $91.00 $95.00 $85.40 NO BID
Section 25 $15.99 $15.95 $17.00 $17.00 $16.15 NO BID
Section 26 NO BID $98.00 $37.77 $40.25 $37.50 NO BID

Incomplete

Section 27 NO BID section bid $2,954.00 NO BID $3,967.10 NO BID
Section 28-1 NO BID NO BID $490.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Section 28-2 NO BID NO BID $343.00 $393.65 $349.50 NO BID
Section 29 NO BID NO BID $204.00 $75.00 $96.00 NO BID
Section 30 A NO BID $67.21 $61.00 $97.00 $64.30 NO BID




2016 Warehouse Sewer Water Fittings Supplies Bid

St. John the Baptist Parish Council

2016 Water & Sewer Fittings Bid Tabulation

Bid Date: Nov. 17, 2015

Baton Rouge HD Supply Coburn's| Fergusen dba| General Mill

Winwater Waterworks| Cimsco Inc. Supply LA Utilities Supply

Section 30 B NO BID $572.55 $538.00 $782.75 $202.80 $204.54

Section 31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.00 NO BID

Section 32 $14,167.00 $14,450.70 $10,920.00]  $12,528.00 $13,609.00 NO BID
Incomplete

Section 33 NO BID section bid $2,876.80 $3,065.00 $2,930.41 NO BID

Section 34 NO BID $109.57 $165.81 $137.25 $154.35 $110.16

Incomplete Incomplete

Section 35 NO BID section bid $279.27 $282.70 $258.81|  Section Bid

Section 36 NO BID $20.96 NO BID NO BID $27.21 NO BID

Section 37 NO BID $65.53 $80.28 $71.10 $50.60 $48.48

Section 38 $265.00 NO BID $760.00 $366.00 $268.00 NO BID

Section 39 NO BID NO BID $223.51 $156.36 $91.15 NO BID

Section 40 NO BID $159.59 $188.45 $213.35 $151.47 NO BID
IMCOITIPICLE

Section 41 NO BID section bid $535.59 $483.17 $550.40 $337.29

Incomplete

Section 42 $300.00 NO BID $90.00|  Section Bid $73.40 NO BID
mcomplete

Section 43 NO BID section bid $86.36 $129.25 $84.05 NO BID

Section 44 $52.20 $60.35 $120.53 $75.50 $52.70 NO BID

Section 45 NO BID $154.31 $162.55 $169.00 $159.00 NO BID




St. John the Baptist Parish Council
2016 Warehouse Sewer Water Fittings Supplies Bid

2016 Water & Sewer Fittings Bid Tabulation Bid Date: Nov. 17, 2015
Baton Rouge HD Supply Coburn's| Fergusen dba| General Mill
Winwater Waterworks| Cimsco Inc. Supply LA Utilities Supply
Section 46 NO BID $21.81 $22.91 $24.00 $22.40 NO BID
Section 47 $129.00 $133.20 NO BID $168.00 $133.00 NO BID
Section 48 $128.00 $127.20 $96.37 $133.50 $109.50 NO BID
Section 49 $5.80 NO BID $6.10 $9.25 $6.40 NO BID
Section 50 NO BID NO BID $72.00 $55.00 $7.50 NO BID
Section 51 $2,110.00 $1,498.05 $2,752.00 $2,260.00 $1,813.00 NO BID
Section 52 $1,050.00 $1,132.67 $1,311.00 NO BID $1,086.00 NO BID
Section 53 NO BID $2,518.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,484.68
Section 54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Section 55 NO BID NO BID $16.30 NO BID $8.08 NO BID
Section 56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.94 $102.62




