



# ST. JOHN

## THE BAPTIST PARISH

NATALIE ROBOTOM  
PARISH PRESIDENT

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AND PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

JEAN STEWART  
Director

1811 WEST AIRLINE HIGHWAY • LAPLACE, LOUISIANA 70068

February 19, 2019

Mr. Joe Flowers  
ICM of America Inc.  
1040 N. Redmond Rd.  
Jacksonville, AR 72076

**RE: Bid Item: 2019 Water & Sewer Fittings**  
**Bid Date: January 11, 2019**

Dear Mr. Flowers,

We are pleased to advise that some sections of your bid for the 2019 WATER & SEWER FITTINGS Bid to be supplied to St. John the Baptist Parish according to our bid specifications were approved by the Parish Council on February 12, 2019 per the attached Motion.

You were the low price bidder for the sections shown below. We are awarding these bids to the lowest bidder and are aware that in some cases "or equal" items were offered in the bid. If these "or equal" items do not perform satisfactorily, "St. John the Baptist Parish reserves the right to accept or reject any and all bids which the Council feels serves their best interest." as stated on our bid specifications.

A copy of your bid that specifies individual items' pricing is attached. Pricing on these items is in effect through December 31, ~~2019~~: *2020 Kns*

### Section 20

Purchase orders will be issued for each order and the purchase order number **must** be displayed on your invoice.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with St. John the Baptist Parish. If you have any questions regarding this award, please contact **Jean Stewart, Director Purchasing and Procurement**, at (985) 652-9569 or [j.stewart@stjohn-la.gov](mailto:j.stewart@stjohn-la.gov).

Sincerely,

Natalie Robottom  
Parish President

NR/ccn

Enclosure



**St. John the Baptist Parish Council  
2019 Warehouse Sewer Water Fittings Supplies Bid**

**2019 Water & Sewer Fittings Bid Tabulation      Bid Date: January 11, 2019      Number of Bids:**

	Core and Main 11323 Cloverland Ave Baton Rouge, LA 70809	Coburn's Supply 1300 Ridgefield Road Thibodaux, LA 70301	Ferguson Enterprise DBA Louisiana Utilities Supply Co 901 South Labarre Rd. Metairie, LA 70001	Baton Rouge Winwater Works 8940 Buzbee Dr Baton Rouge, LA 70809	ICM of America, Inc 1040 N. Redmond Rd Jacksonville, AR 72076	Joints 10699 Hickson St #20 El Monte, CA 91751	Consolidated Pipe and Supply 812 Little Farms Ave Metairie, LA 70003	General Mill Supplies, Inc. 751 Hill Street Jefferson, LA 70121	Cimisco, Inc. 1840 Land A and R Rd. Metairie, LA 70001
<b>Section 1</b>	\$1.65	\$1.64	\$1.67	\$1,535.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.63	No Bid	\$1.72
<b>Section 2</b>	No Bid	\$7.48	\$3.85	\$10.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.88	No Bid	\$4.16
<b>Section 3</b>	No Bid	\$705.63	\$484.58	\$695.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$531.90
<b>Section 4</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,069.84	\$6,134.34	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,659.62	No Bid	\$5,808.74
<b>Section 5</b>	\$160.42	No Bid	\$155.00	\$325.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$96.86	No Bid	\$131.43
<b>Section 6</b>	No Bid	\$1,595.85	\$1,238.80	\$1,182.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,408.64	No Bid	\$1,477.50
<b>Section 7</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$292.00	\$405.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$407.89	No Bid	\$493.22
<b>Section 8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$194.00	\$222.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$273.34	No Bid	\$222.67
<b>Section 9</b>	No Bid	\$296.70	\$206.00	\$430.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$273.34	No Bid	\$224.61
<b>Section 10</b>	No Bid	\$9,660.65	\$6,781.00	\$8,767.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,984.75	No Bid	\$8,350.74
<b>Section 11</b>	No Bid	\$1,236.66	\$1,321.50	\$1,146.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,197.93	No Bid	\$1,354.37
<b>Section 12</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,118.84	\$1,979.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid/NR	\$2,065.80
<b>Section 13</b>	No Bid	\$130.96	\$88.60	\$86.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.55	No Bid	\$105.61
<b>Section 14</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$43.00	\$37.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.00	No Bid	\$104.00
<b>Section 15</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,008.26	\$6,342.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,213.25	No Bid	\$3,603.00
<b>Section 16</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$606.00
<b>Section 17</b>	No Bid	\$417.67	No Bid	\$750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$606.00

	Core and Main 11323 Cloverland Ave Baton Rouge, LA 70809	Coburn's Supply 1300 Ridgefield Road Thibodaux, LA 70301	Ferguson Enterprise DBA Louisiana Utilities Supply Co 901 South Labarre Rd. Metairie, LA 70001	Baton Rouge Winwater Works 8940 Buzbee Dr Baton Rouge, LA 70809	ICM of America, Inc. 1040 N. Redmond Rd Jacksonville, AR 72076	Joints 10699 Hickson St #20 El Monte, CA 91751	Consolidated Pipe and Supply 812 Little Farms Ave Metairie, LA 70003	General Mill Supplies, Inc. 751 Hill Street Jefferson, LA 70121	Cimco, Inc. 1840 Land A and R Rd. Metairie, LA 70001
Section 18	No Bid	No Bid	\$211.20	\$1,131.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$619.52	No Bid	\$427.39
Section 19	No Bid	\$280.00	\$240.00	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$235.00	No Bid	\$380.00
Section 20	No Bid	\$14,685.28	\$12,553.00	\$13,717.00	\$11,171.00	No Bid	\$13,747.79	No Bid	\$13,402.55
Section 21	No Bid	\$4,638.58	\$3,242.00	\$4,606.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,409.68	No Bid	\$3,254.28
Section 22	No Bid	\$104.92	No Bid	\$181.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.00	\$66.04	\$76.44
Section 23	No Bid	No Bid	\$282.00	\$350.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$271.12	No Bid	\$425.00
Section 24	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,818.34	\$1,509.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$671.13
Section 25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$485.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$151.50	No Bid	\$109.56
Section 26	\$268.87	No Bid	\$278.85	\$845.00	No Bid	\$619.82	No Bid	No Bid	\$288.70
Section 27	No Bid	\$60.05	\$58.10	\$71.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.03	No Bid	\$64.43
Section 28	No Bid	\$243.65	\$197.50	\$475.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$229.46
Section 29	No Bid	No Bid	\$144.30	\$146.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$151.00	No Bid	\$166.17
Section 30	No Bid	\$195.70	\$106.30	\$110.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$103.68	No Bid	\$125.50
Section 31	No Bid	\$2,954.00	\$2,424.00	\$2,485.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,920.66	No Bid	\$3,293.00
Section 32	No Bid	\$1,204.20	\$1,412.00	\$940.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,114.14	No Bid	\$934.00
Section 33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,677.77	\$2,871.56	\$8,300.00
Section 34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$190.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.86	\$117.35	No Bid